

HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE
"PURCHASE OF FOOD"
RFSQ NO. 2020-046-08-19-HAG
WEEK OF: August 24, 2020, thru August 28, 2020

VENDORS			BUSTER LIND PRODUCE	PFG	CANO PRODUCE	LOPEZ VERA PRODUCE	PRIMO TRADING SERVICES	BEN E. KEITH
Item	Description	Pkg.	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE
1	Lettuce	24 ct	18.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2	Tomatoes	25 lbs	16.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3	Cabbage	50 lbs	13.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4	Limes	38 lbs	22.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5	Carrots	50 lbs	12.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6	Onions	50 lbs	16.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7	Celery	30 ct	15.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8	Cucumber	45 lbs	23.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
9	Cilantro	1 bunch	0.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
10	Serrano	1 lb	0.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
11	Sweet Potato	90ct	20.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
12	Potatoes	40 ct	20.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
13	Zucchini	20 lb	17.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14	Eggs XL	15 dz	14.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
15	Fresh Green Beans	27 lb bx	25.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
16.	Fresh Broccoli	14 ct	14.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
17.	Fresh Cauliflower	12 ct	17.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
18.	Spinach	1 lb.	2.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
19.	Green Onions	1 bunch	0.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
20.	Chili Ancho	1 lb.	2.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
21.	Chile Poblano	1 lb.	0.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
22.	Bananas	1 cs.	16.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
23.	Apples	1 cs.	23.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
24.	Oranges	1 cs.	36.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID